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EIR Request

PE\2024\ENQ\51233 EIR - follow up request to 50815.

Please could you re-submit all the original data I requested, but with some changes? I have written my new request 

below to set this out. 

This is a straightforward request that only involves:

a) checking that all data previously submitted matches the request; and,

b) submitting an additional piece of information on the number of exemptions that were accepted for each of the 

exemption categories (i.e. householder; self-build; de minimis; other).

See full details of request on the HUB.

RESPONSE:

16/12/2024 - Final respone, revised information provided.

19 Nov 2024 16 Dec 2024 16 Dec 2024 YES NO

PE\2024\ENQ\51242 EIR - request for copies of any '49 Act Access Agreements that are still in force within the National Park.

RESPONSE:

26/11/2024 - Final response - redacted copies of 3 agreements, A2, A29 and A41 provided.

28 Oct 2024 26 Nov 2024 26 Nov 2024 YES NO

EIR FOI and SAR Disclosure Report



PE\2024\ENQ\51129 EIR - Requested under FOI, dealt with under EIR as classed as environmental information:

1.In any delegated authority agreement with local highway authorities, does the Peak District National Park keep an 

up to date asset register of structures on the public rights of way network in its area?

2.How many stiles (as opposed to gates and gaps) are currently on the public rights of way network within the Peak 

District National Park area.

REQUEST FOR CLARIFICATION:

15/11/2024 - definition of 'structures' on the public rights of way network.

18/11/2024 - clarification received - 'structures' refers to gates and stiles.  Target response date extended to 

13/12/2024.

18/11/2024 - Final response, information not held. Highways Authorities are the responsible bodies within the NP 

boundary, provided links.

05 Nov 2024 18 Nov 2024 13 Dec 2024 YES NO

PE\2024\ENQ\50805 EIR - Please provide a list (in Excel format) of all planning applications submitted from 6th December 2023 to the 

most recent data available where no decision was made within the statutory period (26 weeks for major applications 

and 16 weeks for non-major applications), unless a longer period has/had been agreed in writing between the 

applicant and the Local Authority, and no refund of fees has been made to date.

Requested Columns:

1. Planning application reference

2. Applicant name

3. Site address

4. Valid date

5. Planning application fee paid (£)

6. Decision due date

7. Actual decision date

8. No. of days to decision

9. The decision (e.g., approved, refused, etc.)

10. Extension of time/Planning performance agreement (Yes or No)

11. Refund (Yes or No)

12. Eligible for Refund (Yes or No) (Based on statutory decision deadlines: 16 weeks for non-major applications and 

26 weeks for major applications)

13. Withdrawn (Yes or No)

14. Proposal description

Please provide the information in chronological (date) order.

RESPONSE:

01/10/2024 - Final response - information provided

12 Sep 2024 01 Oct 2024 09 Oct 2024 YES NO



PE\2024\ENQ\51045 EIR - Please may I make a Freedom of Information request relating to biodiversity net gain.

 

My name is [], my address is BDB Pitmans, 1 Bartholomew Close, London EC1A 7BL and my phone number is [].

 

1. How many full planning applications have been made in total since 2 April 2024?

 

2. How many of those applications are subject to mandatory BNG (i.e. not covered by the Biodiversity Gain 

Requirements (Exemptions) Regulations 2024), and please could you provide the application reference numbers for 

those?

 

Note that I have been advised by Idox, the planning application search provider, that there is an internal search 

function for BNG applications but not yet an external one, so if you use that system you are in a better position to 

find these than me and I would be disappointed if you tell me to find out for myself, as that involves looking at every 

planning application whereas you don't need to!

RESPONSE:

20/11/2024 - Final response - information provided in full.

24 Oct 2024 20 Nov 2024 20 Nov 2024 YES NO

PE\2024\ENQ\51177 EIR - Please could someone tell me if prior approval, permitted development,  planning permission (or other 

permission) has been granted for the development of Stanage (Stanedge) Lodge, long causeway, s10 4qz and it's 

outbuildings to additional residential and or commercial use (air bnb, b&b, hostel, hotel etc)?  Or if any 

environmental or habitats assessments/ surveys have been carried out for the ongoing development of the property?

Please could someone confirm the necessary approval/ permission and/ or surveys have taken place for this 

development? Also, if they have been granted/ taken place what they are and what they cover.  If they have not 

been sought/ granted and should have been what action will the PDNP take?

RESPONSE:

12/11/2024 - Final response - some information provided re planning applications, no recent applications, have 

advised that concern re possible unauthorised development should be reported using the online enquiry form.

10 Nov 2024 12 Nov 2024 05 Dec 2024 YES NO



PE\2024\ENQ\51092 EIR - I am writing to request the most recent shape files related to Tree Preservation Orders (TPOs) in a recognized 

vector format. Currently, our ability to analyze TPO-designated areas is limited by insufficient detail, and access to 

these files in vector format is essential for accurate mapping and planning purposes.

27/11/2024 - Final response - information provided

31 Oct 2024 27 Nov 2024 27 Nov 2024 YES NO

PE\2024\ENQ\50815 EIR - Questions regarding planning applications and biodiversity net gain (BNG) compliance.

RESPONSE:

10/10/2024 - Final response - information provided

13 Sep 2024 10 Oct 2024 10 Oct 2024 YES NO

PE\2024\ENQ\51191 EIR - 

If you wouldn't mind sharing the information that I outlined in my emails, which should be in the public domain and 

which you have not provided I'd be grateful. If it is not forthcoming, I'll put in a freedom of information request;

In summary, the public information I'd like to see is as follows;

1. A copy of the archaeological survey and assessment relating to the Leam PAWS sites we have been discussing 

along with details of authors and date of authorship.

2. Details of who the timber from the Leam PAWS site is sold to for the current and future schemes and who it was 

sold to in the 2019-2020 Leam Hall Woodlands thinning exercise? (This is basic public-domain contractual 

information)

3. Details of who the felling is being carried out by/contracted to in this current and future Leam PAWS scheme and 

who the Leam Hall Woodlands thinning was carried out by in 2019-2020? (Again public-domain contractual 

information)

4. Where funding is coming from for this entire scheme? (More public domain contractual information). 

5. How much money the felled larch timber is sold for (public domain)

6. Evidence of definitive cases of P. Ramorum within 5 miles. 

7. Whether there is the intention/plan for the PDNPA to sell the woodland land holding in the future

RESPONSE:

15/11/2024 - initial response, providing some information.

10/12/2024 - final response, further information provided inc. copies of reports.

14 Nov 2024 10 Dec 2024 11 Dec 2024 YES NO

PE\2024\ENQ\50840 EIR - Please could you supply all documents between January 2023 to October 2024 relating to the Farming in 

Protected Landscapes Grant awarded for the construction of a permissive bridleway at Longstone Edge, running from 

Wigley Lane to Moor Road in the Great Longstone area of the Peak District National Park, including the Grant 

application and related correspondence.

RESPONSE:

10/10/2024 - redacted copies of information provided

18 Sep 2024 10 Oct 2024 15 Oct 2024 YES NO



FOI Request

PE\2024\ENQ\51074 EIR - would like to request information on derelict houses under the freedom of information act.

whether the owners are known or not.

I am hoping to acquire one or two and bring them up to rentable standards. I'm looking at contacting the owners or 

tracing the owners if that is unknown.

RESPONSE:

15/11/2024 - Final response, information not held. PDNPA are not responsible for Building Control and do not 

maintain a list of derelict properties. Provided links to District Councils (advised that due to data protection law they 

may not be able to share ownership details), suggested searching the Land Registry and Electoral Role.

29 Oct 2024 15 Nov 2024 25 Nov 2024 YES NO

PE\2024\ENQ\51055 FOI - Could you please send me the following information: 

 - What is your spend with external law firms (please provide for the last 4 financial years)? 

 - Do you use eBilling technology to manage your law firms billing (e.g. systems such as Legal Tracker, Brightflag, 

Apperio, CT Tymetrix, Mitratech etc.)? 

 -  Who is your Head of Legal or General Counsel (please provide email address)? 

- Who is your Head of Procurement (please provide email address)? 

 - Do you have a law firm panel / preferred supplier list / use a framework to buy your external law firm services? 

Please provide details where possible. 

Could you please return the information to me via email?

RESPONSE:

21/11/2024 - Final response, information provided.

25 Oct 2024 21 Nov 2024 21 Nov 2024 YES NO

PE\2024\ENQ\50940 FOI - Do you employ in house mechanics for vehicle and plant maintenance? If so, what is their pay scale & grade? 

Do they receive a tool allowance? Do they receive a market supplement, if so, how much? 

RESPONSE:

04/10/2024 - Final response - DCC manage our vehicle and plant maintenance.

03 Oct 2024 04 Oct 2024 30 Oct 2024 YES NO

PE\2024\ENQ\50948 FOI - questions concerning trade union arrangements at PDNPA. 

RESPONSE:

10/10/2024 - Final response - information provided

07 Oct 2024 10 Oct 2024 01 Nov 2024 YES NO



PE\2024\ENQ\51096 FOI - request for copies of the following:

 -  Part 7 of the Authority's Standing Orders as they stood on 29 September 2023 (and also 10 October 2023) in 

relation to delegated authority to issue Enforcement Notices.  

 - Formal, dated letter confirming [] appointment as Senior Lawyer, with any relevant, supporting background 

information in relation to the change of job title from Assistant Solicitor to Senior Lawyer.

 - Part 7 of the Authority's Standing Orders as they stood on 14 December 2023 in relation to delegated authority to 

issue Enforcement Notices including any relevant reports to the Authority explaining and authorising the changes 

made to the Standing Orders.  

 - Any other relevant documents, emails, notes etc re authority to issue ENs

 - The original, digital word file of the delegated report attached to the EN so that authorship could be established.  

RESPONSE:

19/11/2024 - initial response providing some information and requesting extension of time to consider public interest 

test, extended until 17/12/2024.

17/12/10204 - final response, redacted copy of Senior Lawyer, Planning and Enforcement, job description porvided.  

No further information held.

23 Oct 2024 17 Dec 2024 17 Dec 2024 YES NO


